
 

  

 

 
    

   

     

       
  

   
  

    
   

 

    
  

 

   
  

   
    

  
   

 

     
   

 

    

 

GOVERNMENT OF MEGHALAYA 

HOME (POLICE) DEPARTMENT
 

ORDERS BY THE GOVERNOR
 

NOTIFICATION
 

Dated : Shillong, the 8th August, 2007 

No.HPL.154/87/555 — Whereas for public convenience and better administration the 
Governor of Meghalaya consider it necessary to upgrade Dadenggre Out Post to a 
Police Station at Dadenggre in the West Garo Hills District to be known as the 
Dadenggre Police Station by upgrading the existing Out Post at the above place. 

And, whereas, it is necessary to describe the boundaries and jurisdiction of the new 
Police Station as indicated here-under. 

Now, therefore, the Governor of Meghalaya is pleased to order up-gradation of the 
aforesaid new Police Station at Dadenggre and to describe the boundaries and 
jurisdiction of the New Police Station as indicated hereunder with effect from the date 
of publication of this Notification in the Official Gazette of Meghalaya. On creation of 
the Dadenggre Police Station the areas coming under its jurisdiction shall cease to 
be under the Phulbari Police Station. 

DESCRIPTION BOUNDARIES OF DADENGGRE POLICE STATION 

NORTH : From Khimdegre village running in a westerly direction covering 
Mangotchigre and Dabobonggre village upto Rongdupara village bordering South of 
Tikrikilla PS jurisdiction and East of Phulbari PS jurisdiction. 

EAST : From Khimdegre village running in a south-easterly direction until it meets 
Didram river South-West of Silsekgre village and running in a south westerly 
direction covering Ronngkhemgre, Dananggre upto Chibonggre village and running 
in the southerly direction covering Aphanggre, Demidikgre, Chidetcgre, 
Songkhonggre upto Dodinanggre village area bordering North-West of Tura PS 
jurisdiction. 

WEST : From Dodinanggre village running in a westerly direction upto Rongdokgre 
village bordering North of Tura PS jurisdiction. 

SOUH : From Rongdupara village running in a south westerly direction upto East of 
Khalchengpara village under eastern direction of Turn PS jurisdiction and again 
running in a southerly direction covering Gambrigre, Urenggre, Srop-gre villages 
crossing Ranggira Hills upto Rongdokgre village bordering East of Turn PS 
jurisdiction.  

 Sd/- 

(Smti R.V.Suchiang, IAS),  


Commissioner & Secretary to the Govt. of Meghalaya.
 
Home (Police) Department 



